

FRCOG COLLECTIVE PURCHASING IFB 20190905 - WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS 10/1/2019 - 9/30/2020 - AWARD LIST		Vendor	Deposit	Minimum Delivery	Notes	Price
1	"Aqua-Mag" Blended Phosphate, 30 gallon container	Coyne Chemical Co.		3 containers	See Note 1	\$263.2099/con
2	Chlorine, Gas, 150 lb cylinder	JCI Jones		4 cylinders		\$450/cylinder
3	Citric Acid, 575 lb drum, 50%	Primary Secondary Surpass Chemical Coyne Chemical Co.		1 drum --	See Note 2	\$407.75 / drum \$550.7657 / drum
4	Ferric Chloride, 38-42%, wt-dry	NO BID RECEIVED				
5	Polyaluminum Chloride, Epic WW-58	Holland Company		1,000 gal 3,000 gal		\$2.10 / gal \$1.74 / gal
6	Polyaluminum Chloride, Epic 59	Holland Company		1,000 gal 2,500 gal		\$2.20 / gal \$1.88 / gal
7	Polymer ACP-24, 50 lb bag	Primary Secondary Atlantic Coast Polymers Coyne Chemical Co.		Atlantic Coast - 36 bags --	See Note 3 See Note 4	\$107 / bag \$116.3971 / bag
8	Potassium Hydroxide, 45%, bulk delivery	Primary Secondary Brenntag Northeast, Inc. New Haven Chlor-Alkali		900 gal 1,000 gal		\$4.72 / gal \$4.85 / gal
9	Potassium Permanganate, FREE FLOWING, 55# pail, AWWA gr. MADE IN USA ONLY, Carus material.	Univar		8 pail		\$214.11 / pail
10	Soda Ash (Light) - 50 lb bag or specify	Univar		54 bags		\$17.49 / bag
11	Sodium Chlorite, liquid 25%, bulk delivery	Primary Secondary International Dioxide Monson Companies		1,400 gals 1,400 gals	See Note 5	\$7.36 / gal \$7.40 / gal
12	Sodium Hydroxide, 25% Solution, 55 Gallon drum	Dual Award Dual Award Astro Chemicals Univar	\$50 \$0	1 drum 2 drums		\$326.75 / drum \$181.52 / drum
13	Sodium Hydroxide, 50% Solution, Bulk Del., AWWA gr. Minimum 1000	Univar		1,000 gal		\$2.611 / gal
14	Sodium Hydroxide, 50% Solution, Bulk Del., AWWA gr. Minimum 2000	Univar		2,000 gal		\$2.189 / gal
15	Sodium Hypochlorite, 12.5% Chlorine, Bulk Delivery	Primary Secondary Surpass Chemical New Haven Chlor Alkali		225 gallons 3,000 gallons 225 gallons 3,000 gallons		\$3.264 / gal \$1.012 / gal \$3.50 / gal \$1.08 / gal
16	Sodium Hypochlorite, 12.5% Chlorine, 15 Gallon Carboy	Primary Secondary Univar Surpass Chemical	\$0 \$40	4 carboys 4 carboys		\$92.85 / carboy \$81.11 / carboy
17	Sodium Hypochlorite, 12.5% Chlorine, 55 Gallon Drum	Primary Secondary Univar Surpass Chemical	\$0 \$50	2 drums 2 drums		\$162.25 / drum \$146.54 / drum
18	Sulfur Dioxide, Gas, 150 lb cylinder	JCI Jones	\$0	4 cylinders		\$400 / cylinder
19	Testing Reagent, DPD Free Chlorine PP 25ml, 100 packets/box	NO BID RECEIVED				
20	Testing Reagent, Phosver 3 PWD-PLW 25ml, 100 packets/box	NO BID RECEIVED				
21	Testing Reagent, HACH Cat. #2557000 bottle set	NO BID RECEIVED				
22	473 ML Bottle Free Chlorine Indicator Solution	NO BID RECEIVED				
23	473 ML Bottle Total Chlorine Buffer Solution	NO BID RECEIVED				
24	Corrosion & Scale Control Inhibitor - SeaQuest or equivalent	AquaSmart		50 lbs		\$2.75 / lb

**Note 1 George S. Coyne:** Not all producers fill drums to the same net weight. CP723L has 340 net lbs. per drum. Therefore, its true cost is \$ .7741 / Net Pound. Respectfully request that these facts be taken into consideration when selecting the supplier for this product. Minimum 3 drums per shipment.

**Note 2 George S. Coyne:** Citric Acid 50% is packaged in a 572 lb. net weight drum.

**Note 3 Atlantic Coast Polymers:** ACP-300 is the new product code for the ACP-24, 55 lb bags

**Note 4 George S. Coyne:** Zetag 8140 Polymer is packaged in a 55.12 lb net weight bag.

**Note 5 International Dioxide:** Vendor confirms they will deliver a minimum of 1,400 gallons